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Eden Shiferaw is a dynamic relationship 
builder and political strategist who 
understands the challenges of making 
significant changes in public policy. Eden 
works to bridge the divide between key 
stakeholders and decision makers in 
Washington. She identifies policy and advocacy 
priorities, develops strategies based on those 
priorities, and works skillfully to execute 
those strategies. 

Prior to joining NVG, Eden worked at Olsson 
Frank Weeda Terman Matz PC (OFW Law) 
where her focus remained in healthcare and 
agriculture policy. Eden particularly focused 
on delivery system reform, including Medicare 
payment policy. Eden also assisted clients on 
policy issues related to the Food and Drug 
Administration and the Department of 
Agriculture, including food safety, nutrition, 
biotechnology, meat and poultry issues and 
global food security. Previously, Eden worked 
for Congresswoman Marcia L. Fudge (D-OH) 
where her portfolio included food and nutrition 
policy, and voting rights. 

Eden is a north Texas native and received her bachelor’s degree from Duke University. 




